TABULATION OF BIDS MATERIAL DESCRIPTION: Paver and Sidewalk Cleaning Project
Chuck' Pressure Abe's Power Washing
RECOMMEND:  Clean N Seal VENDOR: Clean N Seal, Inc. Superior Clean and Seal PWSC Steam on Wheels Powerclean Washing Service Service
REASON: Lowest responsible bid for the paver and
sidewalk cleaning project.
9020 Brentwood Blvd, 422 Larkfield Center | 2655 Stanwell Dr., #102
Ste A PO Box 2103 #285 Unit D 3186 Contra Loma Blvd
ADDRESS: Brentwood, CA 94513 Brentwood, CA 94513 | Santa Rosa, CA 95403 Concord, CA 94520 Santa Rosa, CA Antioch, CA 94509 San Ramon
QUOTE DATE: 3/14/2024
PHONE: 925-418-4224 925-628-4891 707-559-8239 925-798-9043 707-492-6279 510-309-5411 925-449-6890
CONTACT: David Pritchett Art Roland Garrett Piland Sean Drayer Chuck Abe
. . garrett@pwscservice.co | info@steamonwheels.co | sean@powercleancalifor | chuckspressurewashing | abe@powerwashingservi
david@cleannseal.com 2277art@gmail.com - - p
EMAIL: m m nia.com @gmail.com cesinc.com
FY 24/25 | FY 25/26 | FY 24/25 | FY 25/26 | FY 24/25 | FY 25/26 | FY 24/25 | FY 25/26 | FY 24/25 | FY 25/26 | FY 24/25 | FY 25/26 | FY 24/25 | FY 25/26
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates Rates
Paver Cleaning Project
Total Cleaning Cost:
1 Sq Ft |Paver cleaning of 50,000 sq. ft of pavers around $0.36 $0.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
City Hall and the Community Center
2 Sq Ft |Sealing of pavers throughout project $0.55 $0.55
3 Sq Ft_|Re-sanding pavers throughout project $0.20 $0.20
4 Sq Ft |Spot cleaning costs $0.20 $0.20
Sidewalk Cleaning Project
Total Cleaning Cost:
1 Square foot cost $0.16 $0.17
2 60,000 sq. foot total cost (1 service) $9,600.00 [$10,200.00
3 120,000 sq. foot total cost (2 services) $19,200.00 | $20,400.00
4 Spot cleaning sq. foot cost (3 Hour Minimum) $0.20 $0.20
TOTAL:| $28,801.67 | $30,601.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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